FOI: 36442 DATE: 26/04/2018 SUBIJECT: Urinary Sheaths

QUESTION

Please can | request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act:

1. How many sheaths does your Trust use on average per patient per day?

2. What is the average length of stay for patients using a urinary sheath?

3. Of the total number of male patients with urinary incontinence, what percentage would use:
a) Urinary incontinence pads
b) Urinary sheaths

Stockport NHS Foundation Trust does not hold the information requested coded within a system that allows us to extract that level of data for you under
this part of your request. Therefore the data is not held in a retrievable system. Under the Freedom of Information Act (Section1) we must therefore “deny”
that the data is held.

ATTACHMENT: No



